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Does "let's" mean you will as Tom or you would like me to? I'm happy to.
----- Qriginal Message-----

From: Kavanaugh, Brett M.
Sent:  Sunday, June 22, 2003 5:10 PM

To: Litkenhaus, Colleen
Subject: Re: FW: Are you sure the campaign didn't have to pay for
it?

First, how did they travel? | believe campaign should pay for
cost of trip back and forth to Boston since that was the only
campaign-related event. RNC and govt should pay the remains. But let's
make sure Josefiak is ok with that.

From: Colleen Litkenhaus/WHO/EOP@Exchange on 06/22/2003 04:15:33 PM
Record Type: Record

To: Brett M. Kavanaugh/WHO/EOP@EOP
CcG:
Subject: FW: Are you sure the campaign didn't have to pay for it?

Alicia went on a trip with Secretary Card and the RNC paid for it. Please
find components below. Who should have paid for this ticket?

----- Original Message-----

From: Davis, Alicia W.

Sent:  Wednesday, June 18, 2003 3:46 PM

To: Litkenhaus, Colleen

Subject: Re: Are you sure the campaign didn't have to pay for it?
We had 5 components to the trip:

1) Bush Cheney Pre-Sell (not a fundraiser-meeting with supporters)
2) Press Interviews in MA

3) Press Interviews in NH

4) NH GOP Party Building Event (RNC)

5) Boy Scouts

So?



P6/(b)(6)

(b)(7)c) |

(b)(7){e)
{b)(7)f)

From: Colleen Litkenhaus/WHO/EOP@Exchange on 06/18/2003 03:00:36 PM
Record Type: Record

To: Alicia W. Davis/WHO/EOP@EOP

e

Subject: Are you sure the campaign didn't have to pay for it?
Event: Bush ) Cheney 04

Finance Luncheon

12:00 p.m. Secretary Card begins participation in

Bush-Cheney 04 finance event
Congress Room

Harvard Club

1 Federal St, 38th floor

Boston, Massachusetts

----- Qriginal Message-----

From: Davis, Alicia W.

Sent:  Wednesday, June 18, 2003 2:44 PM
To: Litkenhaus, Colleen

Subject: Re: FW:

RNC-we had a party building event in there.

From: Colleen Litkenhaus/WHO/EOP@Exchange on 06/17/2003 09:15:09 AM
Record Type: Record

To: Alicia W. Davis/WHO/EOP@EOP
CG:
Subject: FW:

who paid for your ticket? The campaign, RNC or WHO?

----- Original Message-----

From: Bennett, Melissa S.

Sent: Tuesday, June 17, 2003 8:38 AM

To: Rob Digiuse; Glenn Kessler; joc (jocatsaic@usss-treas.gov);

|; Lin Tynes; Riepenhoff, Allison L.; Bennett,

Melissa S_; Estes, Ashley; Gambatesa, Linda M.; Gary Lowman; Gottesman,
Blake; Kaplan, Joel D.; Kupfer, Jeffrey F_; Kyle, Ross M_; Litkenhaus,
Colleen; Mallea, Jose; Reynolds, Tim

Subject:

Jose and Alicia Davis are traveling with the Chief today.



Thanks.
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